

MISC Personal Protective Equipment
Bid #21-542-IB-CARES-01A - Surgical Masks
Quantity Needed - 30,000ea
4:00PM Thursday, November 5, 2020

VENDOR	Brand	Unit of Packaging	# of units per Package	Price per Package	Shipping	Total Price	Delivery Period	Quantity Avail for Shipping	Comments
American Consumer Products	Magicare	Case	2,000	\$58.00	\$0.00	\$870.00	7 days	30,000	Can not verify ASTM level status from mfg website at magicare.us
Arvessa Care	Arvessa	Case	2,000	\$480.00	\$0.00	\$7,200.00	15+ Days	0	Can not verify ASTM level status from mfg website at www.arvessacare.com
ASA TechMed	TAIZHOU KANGJIAN MEDICAL EQUIPMENT	Case	2,000	\$180.00	\$0.00	\$2,700.00	4 days	30,000	ASTM level 1 verified, FDA reg and certificate, Made in China
Beverly Knits									NO BID
Boundtree		Case	2,000	\$1,079.60	\$0.00	\$16,194.00	Indeterminable	Indeterminable	
BSN Sports									NO BID
Digital Gadgets	GDYYMASK	Each	30,000	\$0.07	\$200.00	\$2,300.00	5 days	5,000,000	Could not verify ASTM level status from any website selling GDYYMASK
Dunwell Supply & Service	MAGID	Case	2,000	\$350.00	\$5,250.00	\$5,250.00	7 days	30,000	ASTM Level 1 verified, FDA certificate, Made in China
Eveready First Aid	Hayford Health LLC	Case	500	\$90.00	\$0.00	\$5,400.00	10 days	30,000	ASTM Level 1 verified,
Frontline Crossings	Frontline Crossing	Box	30,000	\$0.17	\$0.00	\$5,100.00	28 days	5,000,000	ASTM level 3 verified,
GDI Medical	DINH Hung	Case	2,000	\$80.00	\$0.00	\$1,200.00	3 days	30,000	Can not verify ASTM level 1 from GDI medical website
GIMDX, Inc	Improve	Each	30,000	\$0.17	\$5,100.00	\$5,100.00	5 days	50,000	Can not verify ASTM level 1 from GIMDX website
Global PPE	Globel PPE	Case	2,000	\$0.115	\$0.00	\$3,450.00	30 days	12,000	ASTM Level 1 verified. ***Not enough in stock for shipment***
Government MLO Supplies, USA	Government MLO	Case	2,000	\$350.00	\$150.00	\$5,400.00	5 days	90,000	Could not verify ASTM level status from any website selling governmentmosupplier.com
GroGreen Solutions	TAIZHOU KANGJIAN MEDICAL EQUIPMENT	Case	2,000	\$0.10	\$0.00	\$3,000.00	10 days	2,000,000	ASTM level 1 verified, FDA reg and certificate, Made in China
Hawk Health & Safety									NO bid found in the information
IFB-3		Case	2,500	\$0.19	\$0.00	\$5,700.00	5 days	1,000,000	ASTM level 1 verified.
Innovative Federal Operations Group	BYD Care	Case	2,000	\$0.40	\$0.00	\$12,000.00	5 days	30,000	ASTM Level 1 Verified
ISO Medical Supply	ISO Medical	Case	2,500	\$300.00	\$600.00	\$4,200.00	7 days	4,000,000	Could not verify ASTM level status from ISO medical.
Jointown International-US Health Express	Metiko	Case	500	\$25.00	\$300.00	\$1,800.00	10 days	30,000	ASTM level 1 verified. ***Made in China***
Kentron Healthcare									NO BID
Liberty Paper	Liberty	Case	2,000	\$240.00	\$0.00	\$3,600.00	10 days	30,000	Could not verify ASTM level status from Liberty Paper
LNJ Capital	LNJ	Case	2,000	\$98.00	\$0.00	\$1,470.00	10 days	30,000	Could not verify ASTM level status from Lnjcapital.com
LogMet Solutions		Case	2,000	\$1,153.49	\$0.00	\$17,302.35	5 Days	30,000	Could not verify ASTM level status from logmet solutions
M Davis Associates									NO BID
Maitri, LLC		Case	2,000	\$500.00	\$0.00	\$7,500.00	10 days	2,000,000	Could not verify ASTM level status from Maitri, LLC
Malor & Company		each	30,000	\$2.00	\$0.00	\$60,000.00	30 days	2,000	Could not verify ASTM level status from Marlor and Company
MCT Pro Tools		Case	2,000	\$240.00	\$0.00	\$3,600.00	5 days	30,000	Could not verify ASTM level status
Nationwide Source		Case	2,000	\$1,780.00	\$2,550.00	\$29,250.00	7 days	30,000	Could not verify ASTM level status
Need for Life		Case	2,000	\$280.00	\$0.00	\$4,200.00	4 days	30,000	Could not verify ASTM level status
Perfect Stix, LLC		Case	2,000	\$549.50	\$0.00	\$8,242.50	3 days	30,000	Could not verify ASTM level status
Performance Safety Group									
Products Unlimited		Case	2,000	\$461.52	\$0.00	\$6,922.80	10 days	30,000	Could not verify ASTM level status
Protex Labs		Case	2,000	\$158.00	\$0.00	\$2,370.00	7 days	30,000	Could not verify ASTM level status
Safe Time Supplies		Case	2,000	\$60.00	\$100.00	\$1,000.00	4 days	30,000	Could not verify ASTM level status
Safety Zone Specialists		Case	2,000	\$95.00	\$725.00	\$2,150.00	7 days	100,000	Could not verify ASTM level status
Schwent Law	Henan Huibo Medical Co.,Ltd.	Case	2,000	\$320.00	\$0.00	\$4,800.00	5 days	750,000	ASTM Level 3 verified ***Made in China *** Awarded depending on Availability
Sports Brand Group		Case	30,000	\$0.08	\$0.00	\$2,400.00	45 days	30,000	Could not verify ASTM level status
Texas Medical		Case	1,600	\$240.00	\$0.00	\$4,500.00	14 days	30,000	Could not verify ASTM level status
Titan Protect									
Ultimate Innovations Co., UK		Case	2,000	\$0.14	\$0.00	\$4,200.00	15 days	30,000	Could not verify ASTM level status
Unipak									
United Sewing, Inc	united sewing	Case	30,000	\$0.29	\$50.00	\$8,750.00	1 day	3,268,000	ASTM Level 3 verified ***Made in USA ***
Uttech Products	intertek	Case	2,000	\$160.00	\$0.00	\$2,400.00	3 days	unknown	ASTM Level 1 verified *** can not verify if able to meet the needs in stock ***
Uweport, LLC		Case	2,000	\$500.00	\$0.00	\$7,500.00	5 days	74,000	Could not verify ASTM level status
Vaswani, Inc		Case	2,000	\$300.00	\$300.00	\$4,800.00	14 days	0	do not have any in stock
Vehicle Maintenance Program		Case	1,000	\$60.00	\$300.00	\$2,100.00	3 days	30,000	Could not verify ASTM level status
Vizocom	Henan Huibo Medical Co.,Ltd.	Each	30,000	\$0.06	\$120.00	\$1,800.00	10 days	30,000	Could not verify ASTM level status
Zero Shels		Each	2,000	\$0.36	\$0.00	\$10,800.00	10 days	30,000	Could not verify ASTM level status

MISC Personal Protective Equipment
Bid #21-542-IB-CARES-01D - Isolation Gown
Quantity Needed - 10,000ea
4:00PM Thursday, November 5, 2020

VENDOR	Brand	Unit of Packaging	# of units per Package	Price per Package	Shipping	Total Price	Delivery Period	Quantity Avail for Shipping	Notes
American Consumer Products		10,000	1	\$3.125	\$0.00	\$31,255.00	7 days	10,000	AAMI Level 3 verified
Arvessa Care	Kaigeer	10,000	1	\$3.20	\$0.00	\$32,000.00	15 days	unknown	unable to verify AAMI level 3
ASA TechMed	Manufacturer: Shaoxing Tongjing Garments Co., Ltd	10,000	1	\$2.75	\$0.00	\$27,500.00	4 days	10,000	AAMI Level 2 verified
Beverly Knits		10,000	1	\$4.95	\$0.00	\$49,500.00	10 days	2,000	AAMI level 1 verified
Boundtree	Dukal Corporation	10,000	1	\$0.41	\$0.00	\$4,129.65	unknown	unknown	unable to verify AAMI level 3
BSN Sports		10,000	1						
Digital Gadgets		10,000	1						
Dunwell Supply & Service		10,000	1	\$3.00	\$0.00	\$30,000.00	7 days	10,000	unable to verify AAMI level 3
Everready First Aid		10,000	1	\$4.88	\$0.00	\$48,848.80	10 days	10,000	unable to verify AAMI level 3
Fronline Crossings		10,000	1	\$4.89	\$0.00	\$48,900.00	31 days	5,000,000	AAMI level 3 verified
GDI Medical		10,000	1	\$1.64	\$0.00	\$16,400.00	3 days	10,000	unable to verify AAMI level 3
GIMDx, Inc		10,000	1						
Global PPE		10,000	1	\$1.55	\$0.00	\$15,500.00	30 days	7,900	unable to verify AAMI level 3
Government MLO Supplies, USA		10,000	1	\$2.85	\$150.00	\$18,650.00	5 days	150,000	unable to verify AAMI level 3
GroGreen Solutions	HUBEI DECHEN BIOTECHNOLOGY CO., LTD8	10,000	1	\$3.99	\$0.00	\$39,900.00	10 days	66,000	AAMI level 2 verified
Hawk Health & Safety		10,000	1						No bids listed
IFB-3		10,000	1	\$4.98	\$0.00	\$49,800.00	14 days	50,000	AAMI level 3 verified
Innovative Federal Operations Group	Weihai Hai Na Bai Chuan Parmaceutical	10,000	1	\$2.50	\$0.00	\$24,937.50	immed	10,000	AAMI Level 3 verified
ISO Medical Supply		10,000	1						
Jointown International-US Health Express		10,000	1	\$1.78	\$3,000.00	\$20,800.00	10 days	10,000	AAMI Level 1 verified
Kentron Healthcare		10,000	1	\$0.79	\$0.00	\$7,880.25	7 days	9,975	unable to verify AAMI level 3
Liberty Paper		10,000	1						
LNJ Capital		10,000	1						
LogMet Solutions		10,000	1	\$5.25	\$0.00	\$52,500.00	5 days	10,000	unable to verify AAMI level 3
M Davis Associates		10,000	1	\$3.25	\$500.00	\$33,000.00	10 days	10,000	AAMI Level 3 verified
Maitri, LLC		10,000	1						
Malor & Company		10,000	1	\$6.24	\$0.00	\$62,444.00	30 days	10,000	unable to verify AAMI level 3
MCT Pro Tools		10,000	1	\$1.45	\$0.00	\$14,500.00	5 days	10,000	unable to verify AAMI level 3
Nationwide Source		10,000	1	\$4.50	\$995.00	\$45,995.00	7 days	10,000	AAMI level 3 verified
Need for Life		10,000	1						
Perfect Stix, LLC		10,000	1	\$2.50	\$0.00	\$25,000.00	8 days	0	unable to verify AAMI level 3
Performance Safety Group		10,000	1	\$2.49	\$0.00	\$24,900.00	7 days	10,000	AAMI level 1 verified
Products Unlimited		10,000	1	\$1.47	\$0.00	\$14,688.00	10 days	10,000	unable to verify AAMI level 3
Protex Labs	everwell	10,000	1	\$0.99	\$0.00	\$9,900.00	10 days	10,000	AAMI level 1 verified
Safe Time Supplies		10,000	1	\$1.85	\$200.00	\$18,700.00	5 days	150,000	unable to verify AAMI level 3
Safety Zone Specialists		10,000	1	\$3.15	\$1,000.00	\$32,500.00	7 days	62,000	AAMI level 3 verified
Schwent Law		10,000	1						
Sports Brand Group		10,000	1	\$2.60	\$0.00	\$26,000.00	41 days	unknown	unable to verify AAMI level 3
Texas Medical		10,000	1	\$3.05	\$0.00	\$30,500.00	14	10,000	AAMI level 3 verified
Titan Protect		10,000	1						
Ultimate Innovations Co., UK		10,000	1	\$3.30	\$0.00	\$33,000.00	20 days	10,000	AAMI level 1 verified
Unipak		10,000	1	\$2.09	\$0.00	\$20,947.50	15 days	10,000	unable to verify AAMI level 3
United Sewing, Inc		10,000	1						
Urech Products		10,000	1	\$1.75	\$0.00	\$17,500.00	3 days	10,000	AAMI level 1 verified
Uweport, LLC		10,000	1	\$2.25	\$0.00	\$22,500.00	14 days	50,000	AAMI level 2 verified
Vaswani, Inc		10,000	1						
Vehicle Maintenance Program		10,000	1	\$2.74	\$500.00	\$27,931.25	7 days	10,000	unable to verify AAMI level 3
Vizocom		10,000	1	\$0.81	\$0.00	\$8,100.00	10 days	10,000	AAMI level 1 verified
Zero Shels		10,000	1	\$4.40	\$0.00	\$44,000.00	10 days	10,000	AAMI level 3 verified

MISC Personal Protective Equipment
Bid #21-542-IB-CARES-01E - Face Shields
Quantity Needed - 10,000ea
4:00PM Thursday, November 5, 2020

VENDOR	Brand	Unit of Packaging	# of units per Package	Price per Package	Shipping	Total Price	Delivery Period	Quantity Avail for Shipping	Notes
American Consumer Products	ACP	Each	10,000	\$0.89	\$0.00	\$8,900.00	7 days	10,000	
Arvessa Care		Each	10,000	\$1.28	\$0.00	\$12,800.00	15 days	unknown	
ASA TechMed	Schenzhen	Each	10,000	\$0.85	\$0.00	\$8,500.00	4 days	10,000	
Beverly Knits									
Boundtree		Each	10,000	\$2.79	\$0.00	\$27,900.00	unknown	unknown	
BSN Sports	Evoshield	Each	10,000	\$25.00	\$0.00	\$250,000.00	15 days	7	
Digital Gadgets		Each	10,000	\$0.79	\$200.00	\$8,100.00	5 days	275,000	
Dunwell Supply & Service		Each	10,000	\$2.50	\$25,000.00	\$25,000.00	7 days	10,000	
Everready First Aid		Each	10,000	\$1.18	\$0.00	\$11,894.40	10 days	10,000	
Fronline Crossings		Each	10,000	\$0.85	\$0.00	\$8,500.00	31 days	5,000,000	
GDI Medical	IEYANG JIAYI PLASTIC PRODUCTS CO., LTD.	Each	10,000	\$0.33	\$0.00	\$3,300.00	3 days	10,000	*** Winning bid with availability***
GIMDx, Inc									
Global PPE		Each	10,000	\$0.75	\$0.00	\$7,500.00	4 days	10,000	
Government MLO Supplies, USA									
GroGreen Solutions	BRIOPPE	Each	10,000	\$0.85	\$8,500.00	\$8,500.00	10 days	125,000	
Hawk Health & Safety									*** no bids included ***
IFB-3	IEYANG JIAYI PLASTIC PRODUCTS CO., LTD.	Each	10,000	\$0.98	\$0.00	\$9,800.00	14 days	500,000	
Innovative Federal Operations Group	Apexx Co	Each	10,000	\$0.75	\$0.00	\$7,500.00	5 days	10,000	
ISO Medical Supply									
Jointown International-US Health Express	Jointown	Each	10,000	\$0.625	\$250.00	\$6,500.00	10 days	10,000	
Kentron Healthcare		Each	10,000	\$0.79	\$0.00	\$7,900.00	10 days	10,000	
Liberty Paper									
LNJ Capital									
LogMet Solutions		Each	10,000	\$0.74	\$0.00	\$7,376.00	5 days	10,000	
M Davis Associates									
Maitri, LLC									
Malor & Company		Each	10,000	\$1.59	\$0.00	\$15,900.00	30 days	10,000	
MCT Pro Tools		Each	10,000	\$0.54	\$0.00	\$5,400.00	4 days	10,000	
Nationwide Source		Each	10,000	\$1.95	\$995.00	\$20,495.00	7 days	10,000	
Need for Life		Each	10,000	\$1.00	\$0.00	\$10,000.00	4 days	10,000	
Perfect Stix, LLC		Each	10,000	\$4.80	\$0.00	\$48,000.00	8 days	0	
Performance Safety Group	PSG	Each	10,000	\$1.99	\$0.00	\$19,900.00	5 days	10,000	
Products Unlimited		Each	10,000	\$1.55	\$0.00	\$15,500.00	14 days	10,000	
Protex Labs		Each	10,000	\$0.69	\$0.00	\$6,900.00	7 days	10,000	
Safe Time Supplies		Each	10,000	\$0.70	\$400.00	\$7,400.00	7 days	10,000	
Safety Zone Specialists		Each	10,000	\$2.30	\$1,000.00	\$24,000.00	7 days	211,000	
Schwent Law									
Sports Brand Group		Each	10,000	\$2.25	\$0.00	\$22,500.00	44 days	0	
Texas Medical		Each	10,000	\$1.99	\$0.00	\$19,900.00	14 days	10,000	
Titan Protect									
Ultimate Innovations Co., UK		Each	10,000	\$0.48	\$0.00	\$4,800.00	10 days	10,000	
Unipak									
United Sewing, Inc									
Urech Products		Each	10,000	\$0.80	\$0.00	\$8,001.60	3 days	10,000	
Uwepport, LLC		Each	10,000	\$1.50	\$0.00	\$15,000.00	5 days	17,000	
Vaswani, Inc									
Vehicle Maintenance Program		Each	10,000	\$1.05	\$500.00	\$11,000.00	7 days	10,000	
Vizocom	Yiwo Huabiao Packaging Co. Ltd	Each	10,000	\$0.34	\$0.00	\$3,400.00	10 days	10,000	
Zero Shels		Each	10,000	\$3.10	\$0.00	\$31,000.00	10 days	10,000	

MISC Personal Protective Equipment
Bid #21-542-IB-CARES-01F - N95 Face Mask (8210 Replacement)

Quantity Needed - 20,000ea
 4:00PM Thursday, November 5, 2020

VENDOR	Brand	Unit of Packaging	# of units per Package	Price per Package	Shipping	Total Price	Delivery Period	Quantity Avail for Shipping	Notes
American Consumer Products									
Arvessa Care	Makrite	1	20,000	\$1.95	\$0.00	\$39,000.00	15 days	unknown	n95 verified ***not in stock***
ASA TechMed									
Beverly Knits									
Boundtree		1	20,000	\$0.61	\$0.00	\$12,123.75	unknown	unknown	n95 verified ***not in stock***
BSN Sports									
Digital Gadgets									
Dunwell Supply & Service		1	20,000	\$2.50	\$0.00	\$49,950.00	7 days	20,000	unable to verify n95
Everready First Aid	3m	1	20,000	\$3.46	\$0.00	\$69,250.00	7 days	20,000	n95 verified *8210*
Fronline Crossings	Dasheng	1	20,000	\$4.85	\$0.00	\$97,000.00	31 days	5,000,000	N95 verified
GDI Medical	Suzhou Fangtian Industries Co., Ltd.	1	20,000	\$2.11	\$0.00	\$42,200.00	3 days	20,000	N95 Verifeid
GIMDx, Inc									
Global PPE	Harley	1	20,000	\$2.20	\$0.00	\$44,000.00	4 days	20,000	N95 Verifeid
Government MLO Supplies, USA	Government Supplies	1	20,000	\$2.07	\$150.00	\$41,400.00	5 days	20,000	N95 Verifeid
GroGreen Solutions									
Hawk Health & Safety									
IFB-3	Makrite	1	20,000	\$3.85	\$0.00	\$64,800.00	14 days	50,000	N95 Verifeid
ISO Medical Supply									
Jointown International-US Health Express	Makrite	1	20,000	\$2.30	\$502.00	\$46,500.00	10 days	24,000	N95 Verified
Kentron Healthcare		1	200,003						
Liberty Paper		1	20,000						
LNJ Capital	3M	1	20,000	\$4.50	\$0.00	\$90,000.00	10 days	20,000	n95 verified *8210*
LogMet Solutions		1	20,000	\$2.90	\$0.00	\$58,000.00	5 days	20,000	n95 verified *8210*
M Davis Associates									
Maitri, LLC									
Malor & Company		1	20,000	\$0.53	\$0.00	\$10,500.00	30 days	20,000	Unable to verify N95
MCT Pro Tools		1	20,000	\$2.70	\$0.00	\$54,000.00	7 days	20,000	Unable to verify N95
Nationwide Source		1	20,000	\$6.75	\$1,995.00	\$136,995.00	7 days	20,000	N95 Verified
Need for Life		1	20,000	\$2.85	\$0.00	\$57,000.00	10 days	20,000	N95 Verified
Perfect Stix, LLC									
Performance Safety Group									
Products Unlimited	Honeywell	1	20,000	\$2.90	\$0.00	\$57,936.00	21 days	9,000	n95 verified ***low stock***
Protex Labs	makrite	1	20,000	\$1.99	\$0.00	\$39,800.00	7 days	20,000	n95 verified *** winning bid with cost and availability***
Safe Time Supplies		1	20,000	\$3.40	\$0.00	\$68,000.00	7 days	242,000	can not verify n-95 because no model number was listed.
Safety Zone Specialists		1	20,000	\$0.98	\$800.00	\$20,400.00	7 days	400,000	Unable to verify N95
Schwent Law	xiantai mfg	1	20,000	\$3.10	\$0.00	\$62,000.00	21 days	0	n95 verified ***not in stock***
Sports Brand Group		1	20,000	\$3.75	\$0.00	\$75,000.00	40 days	1,000	n95 verified ***low stock***
Texas Medical	Texas Medical	1	20,000	\$3.75	\$0.00	\$75,003.75	14 days	20,000	n95 verified
Titan Protect	makrite	1	20,000	\$2.92	\$0.00	\$58,310.00	5 days	40,000	n95 verified
Ultimate Innovations Co., UK		1	20,000	\$3.41	\$0.00	\$68,200.00	10 days	20,000	n95 verified
Unipak	Makrite	1	20,000	\$2.80	\$0.00	\$56,000.00	10 days	20,000	n95 verified
United Sewing, Inc									
Urech Products									
Uwepport, LLC									
Vaswani, Inc									
Vehicle Maintenance Program		1	20,000	\$2.49	\$500.00	\$50,300.00	7 days	20,000	Unable to verify N95
Vizocom	vizocare	1	20,000	\$3.57	\$0.00	\$71,400.00	14 days	0	n95 verified ***not in stock***
Zero Shels	Zero Shels	1	20,000	\$5.37	\$0.00	\$107,400.00	10 days	20,000	n95 verified

MISC Personal Protective Equipment
Bid #21-542-IB-CARES-01G - PPE Kits
Quantity Needed - 6,000ea
4:00PM Thursday, November 5, 2020

VENDOR	Brand	Unit of Packaging	# of units per Package	Price per Package	Shipping	Total Price	Delivery Period	Quantity Avail for Shipping	Notes
American Consumer Products									
Arvessa Care									
ASA TechMed		Each	1	\$2.50	\$0.00	\$15,000.00	10 days	2,000	Not enough Quantity available to ship before deadline
Beverly Knits									
Boundtree	Curaplex	Each	1	\$6.49	\$0.00	\$38,940.00	unknown	unknown	
BSN Sports									
Digital Gadgets									
Dunwell Supply & Service									
Everready First Aid	Everready	Each	1	\$3.00	\$0.00	\$18,000.00	30 days	6,000	Kits are assembled after order
Fronline Crossings									
GDI Medical	GDI medical	Each	1	\$2.56	\$0.00	\$15,360.00	15 days	6,000	*** winning bid with availability ***
GIMDx, Inc									
Global PPE									
Government MLO Supplies, USA									
GroGreen Solutions									
Hawk Health & Safety									
IFB-3		Each	1	\$5.95	\$0.00	\$35,700.00	14 days	20,000	
Innovative Federal Operations Group		Each	1	\$5.25	\$0.00	\$31,500.00	2 weeks	6,000	
ISO Medical Supply									
Jointown International-US Health Express									
Kentron Healthcare		Each	1	\$3.89	\$0.00	\$23,340.00	30 days	1,200	
Liberty Paper									
LNI Capital									
LogMet Solutions		Each	1	\$9.37	\$0.00	\$56,220.00	5 days	6,000	
M Davis Associates									
Maitri, LLC									
Malor & Company		Each	1	\$10.00	\$0.00	\$60,000.00	30 days	6,000	
MCT Pro Tools									
Nationwide Source									
Need for Life									
Perfect Stix, LLC		Each	1	\$7.99	\$0.00	\$47,940.00	5 days	6,000	
Performance Safety Group									
Products Unlimited									
Protex Labs									
Safe Time Supplies		Each	1	\$3.50	\$550.00	\$21,550.00	15 days	6,000	3 days for kit assembly
Safety Zone Specialists									
Schwent Law									
Sports Brand Group									
Texas Medical									
Titan Protect									
Ultimate Innovations Co., UK		Each	1	\$4.48	\$0.00	\$26,880.00	20 days	6,000	Total cost doesn't add up to individual cost.
Unipak									
United Sewing, Inc									
Utech Products		Each	1	\$3.50	\$0.00	\$21,000.00	14 days	unknown	
Uweport, LLC									
Vaswani, Inc									
Vehicle Maintenance Program									
Vizocom									
Zero Shels		Each	1	\$8.00	\$0.00	\$48,000.00	12 days	0	